
 

Hey All! 
 
A Month Later… 
And I already feel like I’ve learned so much through my internship with Athletes in 
Action.  The biggest aspect I’ve been learning about is practical ministry.  As I’ve told 
many of your before one area I am really excited about is discipleship/mentoring.  
I’ve come to realize how inexperienced I am.  The good news is I have been shad-
owing my campus director, Jon, for the past two weeks, during his 1-on-1 meetings 
with guys.  After the meeting is over, we then have time to reflect on and evaluate 
the meeting.  This gives me a better feel for discipleship.  The coolest thing is that 
each meeting is unique in its own way and you really need to be sensitive to the Holy 
Spirit’s leading.  Discipleship is what gets me fired up!  It is such an encouragement 
to see the enthusiasm for God and His Word from young athletes. 
 
We needed to end a meeting at 1:15pm so Bilal (a football player) could get to prac-
tice on time.  At 1:12pm Jon decided to stop short. Yet, the young man asked to go 
through one more passage of Scripture before he left.  As I look back on it, my heart 
can only smile.  It might have been a small gesture, but it’s not too often I see that 
kind of eagerness for the things of God. 
 
Videos on Demand 
Another aspect of my ministry with AIA has been working on video editing.  My 
friend, Daniel, recently bought me a copy of Adobe Premiere Pro CS5 for my minis-
try.  Jon and I are putting together some videos from this past summer’s Ultimate 
Training Camp.  Through this I’ve had a chance to reminisce about UTC.  It was a 
great time where God touched the lives of so many athletes.  Check my website for 
links to some of the videos! 
 
Church  
We had our Harvest Festival!  It was tons of fun with a variety of games for the kids, 
a jumping castle, and our newest event, the dunk tank!  More importantly, a lot of 
people showed up and I hope they were able to see Jesus in our church body.  Check 
out my picture… Can you guess what I was? 
 
Daily Life 
God has really been pressing upon my heart the importance of how I live my life day 
by day.  I think I get caught up in the future, wondering where I’m going to be or 
what I’m going to do.  I need to focus on the here and now.  But I also believe that 
the future will become clearer as I seek the Lord on a daily basis. 
 
Thank You 
God continues to remind me of those of you who are supporting me!  I could not 
do it without you.  Thank you so very much for your financial generosity as well as 
your prayers.  You are truly investing in Kingdom growth! 
 
Working together, 
Jeremy 

Jeremy M. Wong 

OCTOBER 2010 VOLUME 1, ISSUE 3 

For more information, you can check out my website at www.wongside.com/jeremy 

Bringing Athletes Closer To God In A Real Way 

Me and Aaron (a track 

sprinter) on the UA Mall 

listening to an apologist, 

Cliffe Knechtle 

 

Cliffe is a wonderful 

inspiration! 

Me and Brittany at our 

church’s annual Harvest 

Festival! 

Aaron and I went to the 

UA vs. OSU football 

game.  Our first lost of the 

season :( 


